The County of El Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division
Phone {530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BiD# 22-680-001
Law Enforcement Duty and Safety Gear.

The apparent low qualified bidders for the subject bid are:

Category 1: LC Action Police Supply of San Jose, CA,

Caiegory 2: Gall, LLC of Lexington, KY ;

Category 3: LC Action Police Supply of San Jose, GA,,
Adamson Police Supply of Livermore, CA. and
Galls, LLC of Lexington, KY.

A Spreadsheset is attached for your review.

Purchase orcer contracis will be issued for the awarded period ten {10} business days
following the date this notification is posted on the Procurement & Contracts intemet site:

hitp:ifedcapps.edecgov. us/contracts/bidresulis asp

Board of Supervisors Policy C-17, seciion 5.6.5, contains the procedure for the protest process.
Copies are available upon request

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracis QOffice, and are available to review by
appointment batween 8:00 a.m. — 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. — 4:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer at (530) 821-8873.

Thank you for vour participation in the competitive bid process.

PHhl f) s

Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane, Placerville, CA 95667



Formal Bid # 22-680-0001 Law Enforcement Duty and Safety Gear

A B C
Lava Dog Fire & Police Supply Delta Wireless, Inc. LC Action Police Supply
Category "1" Bianchi Accumold Elite Black Basket Weave Gear Plymouth, CA Sacramento, CA San Jose, CA
Bid | Est. Brand Model Extended Extended
# | Usage # Description Unit Price Extended Price| Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
1 100 Bianchi 7950 Accumold Elite Duty Belt $ 43.00| $ 4,300.00 $ - $ 3745 (%  3,745.00
2 100 Bianchi 7915 Accumold Elite Glove Pouch $ 1824 | $ 1,824.00 $ - $ 1574 | % 1,574.00
3 100 Bianchi 7907 Accumold Elite QC Spray Pouch- small $ 2258 | % 2,258.00 $ - $ 1954 | % 1,954.00
4 100 Bianchi 7911 Accumold Elite Fiashlight Holder $ 2258 | % 2,258.00 $ - $ 1954 | § 1,954.00
5 100 Bianchi 7917 Accumold Elite Double Handcuff Case w/ Hidden Snap $ 27r851 % 2,785.00 $ - $ 2415 $ 241500
6 100 Bianchi 7900 Accumold Elite Single Handcuff Case w/ Hidden Snap $ 23191 % 2,319.00 $ - $ 2008 | $ 2,008.00
7 100 Bianchi 7909 Accumold Elite Flashlight Holder $ 743 % 743.00 $ - $ 624 (5% 624.00
8 100 Bianchi 7906 Accumold Elite Belt Keepers Hidden Snap Model $ 1020 [ $ 1,020.00 $ - $ 368 |% 868.00
9 100 Bianchi 7904 Accumold Elite Baton Rigns $ 83418 834.00 $ - $ 705(% 705.00
10 100 Bianchi 7916 Accumoid Elite Sient Key Holders $ 1824 | $ 1,824.00 $ - $ 1574 | $ 1,574.00
i1 100 Bianchi 79148 Accumold Elite Radio Holder w/ Swivel $ 3836 (% 3,836.00 $ - $ 3338 (%  3,338.00
12 100 Bianchi 7902 Accumold Elite Double Magazine Pouch $ 30321 8% 3,032.00 $ - $ 2633 |% 2633.00
13 40 Bianchi 7902 Accumold Elite Double Magazine Pouch for .45 cal weapon $ 3077 [ $ 1,230.80 $ - $ 2633 | $ 1,063.20
14 20 Bianchi 7903 Accumold Elite Single Magazine / Knife Pauch $ 19.18 | $ 383.60 $ - $ 1655 | $ 331.00
15 30 Bianchi 90060 Accumold Replacement Buckles $ 4951 % 148.50 $ - $ 500|% 150.00
16 10 Bianchi 7320 Accumold Double Magazine Pouch $ 2228 | % 222 .80 $ - $ 1927 | $ 192.70
17 10 Bianchi 7302 Double Magazine Pouch $ 2475| % 247 .50 $ - $ 2144 | § 214.40
18 10 Bianchi 7360 Covered Handcuff Case $ 2010 | $ 201.00 $ E $ 1737 | § 173.70
19 10 Bianchi 7317 Double Handcuff Case $ 1733 | § 173.30 $ - $ 1492 | $ 149.20
20 10 Bianchi 7326 Compact Light Holder $ 12.38 | $ 123.80 $ - $ 1058 [ $ 105.80
21 10 Bianchi 8007 OC/Mace Spray Holder $ 12.06 | $ 120.60 $ - $ 14141 % 141.10
22 10 Bianchi 7200 Duty Belt - Loop 2.25" $ 3681 | 8% 368.10 $ - $ 3203 (% 320.30
Evaluation Sub-Totals for Category 1 $ 30,253.00 $ - $ 26,223.40
Local Vendor Preference 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Payment Discount Terms 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Evaluation Total - Category 1 $ 30,253.00 $ - $ 26,223.40
Delivery - ARO 21-45 Days NO BID Stock / 45 Days
Terms Net 45 Days Net 45




Formal Bid # 22-680-0001 Law Enforcement Duty and Safety Gear

D E F
Proforce Law Enforcement | Adamson Police Supply Galls, LLC
Category "1" Bianchi Accumold Elite Black Basket Weave Gear RIeSCOti A Hivemions; CA e XINEOGY
[Bid| Est. Brand Model Extended Extended Extended

# | Usage # Description Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
1 100 Bianchi 7950 Accumold Elite Duty Belt $ 3869 |$ 3869.00(% 3833[$ 3,833.00/(% 3925 |% 3,925.00
2 100 Bianchi 7915 Accumold Elite Glove Pouch $ 1626 |$ 1626.00|% 1611 [($ 161100 % 1650 | $ 1,650.00
3 100 Bianchi 7907 Accumold Elite OC Spray Pouch- small $ 2018 (% 201800|% 20.00|$ 2,000.00($% 2050 | % 2,050.00
4 100 Bianchi 7911 Accumold Elite Flashlight Holder $ 2018 |$ 201800 % 20.00|% 2,000.00|% 2050 | $ 2,050.00
5 100 Bianchi 7917 Accumold Elite Double Handcuff Case w/ Hidden Snap $ 2495 |$ 249500|$ 2072|$ 297200($ 2530 (% 2,530.00
6 100 Bianchi 7900 Accumold Elite Single Handcuff Case w/ Hidden Snap $ 2074 |$ 207400($ 2055|$% 205500 % 2105 |§ 2,105.00
7 100 Bianchi 7909 Accumold Elite Flashlight Holder $ 6.45| % 64500 6398 639.00 | $ 655 | % 655.00
8 100 Bianchi 7906 Accumold Elite Belt Keepers Hidden Snap Model $ 8971 % 89700|$% 888 (% 889.00 | % 910 | & 910.00
9 100 Bianchi 7904 Accumold Elite Baton Rigns $ 729 | % 72900($ 723([% 723.00 | % 7398 738.00
10 100 Bianchi 7916 Accumold Elite Sient Key Holders $ 1626 [$ 1626.00|% 1611 |$ 1611.00( % 1650 | $ 1,650.00
11 100 Bianchi 79145 |Accumold Elite Radio Holder w/ Swivel $ 3448 (% 344800($ 3416 % 3,416.00( $ 3495 | % 3495.00
12 100 Bianchi 7902 Accumold Elite Double Magazine Pouch $ 271918 271900($ 2694 |$ 2694.00 (% 2760 | % 2,760.00
13 40 Bianchi 7902 Accumold Elite Double Magazine Pouch for .45 cal weapon $ 2719|% 108760 |$ 2694 |% 107760 $ 2760 | $ 1,104.00
14 20 Bianchi 7903 Accumoid Elite Single Magazine / Knife Pouch $ 1710 | 34200 |5 1695 | % 33000 % 1735 | $ 347.00
15 30 Bianchi 90060 Accumold Replacement Buckles $ 430 % 12000 $ 416 % 12480 | $ 430 % 129,00
18 10 Bianchi 7320 Accumold Double Magazine Pouch $ 1990 | $ 19900 | % 1972 ( $ 19720 [ § 2020 | % 202.00
17 19 Bianchi 7302 Double Magazine Pouch $ 22151 % 22150[% 2195|% 21950 | $ 2245 | % 224.50
18 10 Bianchi 7300 Covered Handcuff Case $ 17.94 | $ 17940 | § 1777 | $ 17770 | $ 1820 | $ 182.00
19 10 Bianchi 7317 Double Handcuff Case $ 1542 | % 15420 | % 1528 $ 15280 | $ 15.65| $ 156.50
20 10 Bianchi 7326 Compact Light Holder $ 1093 | $ 109.30 [ $ 1083 | $ 10830 | $ 1110 | $ 111.00
21 10 Bianchi 8007 OC/Mace Spray Holder $ 2018 | $ 201.80 $ - $ 1025 | $ 102.50
22 10 Bianchi 7200 Duty Belt - Loop 2.25" % 3308 (% 33080 | 8% 3278 | $ 32780 | % 3355 (| % 335.50

Evaluation Sub-Totals for Category 1 $ 27,118.60 $ 27,167.70 $ 27,413.00

Local Vendor Preference 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Payment Discount Terms 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Evaluation Total - Category 1 $ 2711860 $ 27,167.70 $ 27.413.00

Delivery - ARO 30-60 Days Net 30-45 Days 3-60 Days

Terms 45 Net 45 Net 45




Formal Bid #22-680-001 Law Enforcement Duty & Safety Gear

A

B

Cc

Lava Dog Fire & Police

Delta Wireless, Inc.

LC Action Police Supply

Supply Sacramento, CA San Jose, CA
Category "2" Point Blank Armor Accessories, Color - Black Plymouth, CA
Bid | Est. . Extended Extended
# |Usage Brand Modslli Description Unit Price Price Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price Price
23] 10 Paint Blank | PCHMPOACOJ |Glock 22 Hand Gun Double Mag Pouch $ - $ - $ -
24 10 Point Blank PCHMR2ACOJ [Md4 Mag Pouch 5 - $ - $ -
25 10 Point Blank PCHHCOACOJ [Handcuff Pouch Stacked $ - $ - $ -
26| 10 Point Blank PCHFLOACOJ [Flashlight Pouch $ - $ - b -
27 10 Point Blank PCHRDOACOJ |Radio Pouch w/Bungee $ - $ - $ -
28 10 Point Blank PCHSPOACOJ |Single 4 Ounce Spray Pouch $ - $ - $ -
29 10 Point Blank PCHUPOACOJ [5"x5" Utility Pouch $ - $ - $ -
30] 10 Point Blank PCHUPQACOJ |Accumold Elite Baton Rigns $ - $ - $ -
Accumold Elite Sient Kev Holiders

Evaluation Sub-Totals for Category 2 $ - $ - $ -

Local Vendor Preference 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Payment Discount Terms 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Evaluation Total - Category 2 $ ) $ - $ ;

Delivery - ARO NO BID NO BID NO BID

Terms




Formal Bid #22-680-001 Law Enforcement Duty & Safety Gear

D E F
ey oporEe.Law Adamson Police Supply Galls, LLC
Enforcement N .
p it AZ Livermore, CA Lexinton, KY
Category "2" Point Blank Armor Accessories, Color - Black IPSCOT,
Bid | Est. e Extended
# |Usage Brand models Description Unit Price Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
23| 10 Point Blank PCHMPOACOJ {Glock 22 Hand Gun Double Mag Pouch $ - $ - 1% 1960 | § 196.00
24 10 Point Blank PCHMR2ACGJ {M4 Mag Pouch $ - $ - 1% 2835( % 283.50
25 10 Point Blank PCHHCQACOJ |Handcuff Pouch Stacked $ - $ - 19 11.85|$ 118.50
26 10 Point Biank PCHFLOACOJ |Flashlight Pouch $ - $ - 1% 14.95| % 149.50
27 10 Point Blank PCHRDOACGJ |Radio Pouch w/Bungee $ - $ - 1% 19.05 | 190.50
28 10 Point Blank PCHSPOACOJ |Single 4 Ounce Spray Pouch 3 - $ - 1% 1235 % 123.50
29 10 Point Blank PCHUPQACOJ (5"x5" Utility Pouch $ = $ - 1% 3760 | % 376.00
30| 10 Point Blank PCHUPOACOJ jAccumold Elite Baton Rigns $ - $ - 1% 3710(% 371.00
Accumold Efite Sient Kev Holders
Evaluation Sub-Totals for Category 2 $ - $ - $ 1,808.50
Local Vendor Preference 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Payment Discount Terms 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Evaluation Total - Category 2 $ _ $ } $ 1,808.50
Delivery - ARO NO BID NO BID 3-60 Days
Terms

Net 45




Formal Bid # 22-680-001 Law Enforcement Duty and Safety Gear

No Bid A B c D E F
Lava Doy Fire & Police Supply Dalte Wirelass, inc. LC Actlan Palice Supply Proforce Law Enfarcamant Adamson Police Supply Galls, LLC
Category "3" Miscellaneous Branded Duty Gear Plymouth, CA Sacramenta, CA San Jose, CA Prascott, AZ Livermaore, CA Laxinton, KY
Bid| Est. e
# |usnge ey Models Description Uniit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
. Duty Holster Right & Left handed for Glock with & without
3 73 Safaritand 6280 Threat Lavel Il Mid ride black basketweaye $ 134 81 5 7832 $ 11v4a § 8 50
32 15 Safatitand 8378 Concealment Paddle Holster wiBelt L 3874 3 3420 $ 3389 s 3470
33 15 Safatiland a3s0 Mid-Ride Level Ill Retension Duty Holster 108.58 3 9852 $ 13414 $ 11030
34| 100 Stinger 75375 Batteries 1527 $ 1337 3 15 65
Ear Phone EP1013XC  |Long Clear tube wi 2 earbuds, 2 aar molds and 15" coiled
£ 54 Connection {Threadad} |cable and 3 Smm ded for poitable mdios $ 4272 $ 20016 $ -
37| 100 EPC Ear Piece Molds $ 800 3 365 $ T
38 80 Ear Hugger £H-EPT-1001 3 3600 $ 42.35 -
k-] 5 Fenix TK20R Rechargeable LED Tactical Flashlight 3 9183 $ 8354 -
40 40 Streamlight 20703 Flashlight w/AC/DC Adaptors 3 118.91 $ 111.74 11208
41 40 Streamlight 75713 Accumold Elite Baton Rigns s 11809 3 101.20 101 51
42| 20 Streamlight 20160 Accumold Elite Sient Key Holders 3 159 s = 142
43 20 Streamlight 75014 Singer Replacement Bulbs $ 850 $ 6.95 581
48 ] Streamlight 20180 SL-20X Replacement Lens H 160 5 - 142
47] 30 Hamberger HWC SBK-1 _|Wollen Seat Belt Cutter - Foldiin; $ 1812 $ 19 44 -
48| 20 Benchmade 7 BLKW |7 Hook Strap Cutter 2775 52 48 -
48] 70 Peeress 700C Chain Link Handcuffs 2010 2108 =
50 5 Aker Agiopp DM S Mace/Cuff Case, Right & Left Handed, Black 4278 45 67 -
LADP Wooden Straight Stick Baton 28" w/ Grommet,
50 st -
a| 20 Koha 100-LAPD-28 Miltary LAPD Style 3 885 5 1488 k]
51 Py} Hatch SGK100 | Street Guard Glove wiKeviar 26 51 $ 1813 $
52 a0 Haten D1 Patrol Duty Bag 46 06 3 3852 38 20 $ 3885
53] 100 Daf Tach DT56833 |MK3 3680 Degrees, 1 3% OC Spray 13 08 s 1105 11.08 $ 1110
54 ir] Def Tach Inert MK-3 Training Spray $ 1048 $ 878 880 3 885
55 50 Sura Fire $ 222 S 86 84 21.97 s 405
58| 50 |N Amer Rescus mmamq.“_hmmm._. Gen 7 Combat Application Toumiquet (CAT), Black H 2201 5 2412 g 24 50 $ 2230
Eleven 10 Rigid Toumiquet for CAT Gen 7 Tourniquet =
57 5 Eleven 10 E10-3011 Case. Black, wiBalt Attachment $ 30 88 $ 3340 $ 3 3138
58| 20 Motorola PMLN7157A |Motorola 2 Wire Surveillance Kit 3 4107 $ 33085 $ = $ 46 25 ] 69 65
Evaluation $ub-Taotais for Category 3 $ - $ - $ - § - s 2 $ =
Local Vandor Preference 0% $0.00 0% $000 0% $0.00 0% $000 0% 50.00 0% $0.00
Payment Discount Terms 0% $0.00 0% $0 00 0% $0 00 0% $000 0% $0.00 0% $000
Evaluation_Total - Category 3 $ ) $ 3 $ - ¥ B $ B $ B
Delivery - ARO 21-45 Days Reject - Cat 3 Stock / 45 Days Nat 3G-60 Days 30-45 Days 3-80 Days
Terms Net 45 Qnly Bid ltem #58 45 Net 45 Net 45 Net 45

Bid lems #35, #44 & #45 Removed From Evaiuation - Discontinued ltems




