The County of El Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division
Phone (530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 22-680-057
Ammunition.

The apparent low qualified bidders for the subject bid are:

Category 1: San Diego Police Equipment Company, Inc. of San Diego, CA.

Category 2: Dooley Enterprises, Inc. of Anaheim, CA.

Category 3: No bids received for this Category.

Category 4: San Diego Police Equipment Company, Inc. of San Diego, CA.

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.

This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, 7/19/2022. Board

of Supervisors Policy C-17, section 5.6.5, contains the procedure for the protest process.
Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, a purchase order / purchase contract will be
issued for the awarded period.

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office, and are available to review by
appointment between 8:00 am. -~ 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. — 4:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer (530) 621-5873.

Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

Michele Weimer

Michele Weimer (Jun 10, 2022 16:55 PDT)

Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 95667



https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAAOAi0RCD8_kStDmY0hL9wwGeSztIcfvqQ

BID #22-680-057

AMMUNITION
Category 1: Federal/Speer Ammunition (A} Uoﬂﬂﬂmmﬁﬂ_m_www. fnc. Ewwmmw.____m“m mmnom
Bid # Part # Description >_“m:m“mmq“_ﬂ~mm%um wopm_%mmmqu mm“.nﬂ.wm_“_ # Unit Price Extension Uni¢ Price Extension
1 53921 Speer Gold DOT 38 Special +P, 135 Grain GDHP-SB 1.000 1.000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $414.20 $414.20
2 53833 Speer, Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain, TMJFN 1,000 1.000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $352.20 $352.90
3 AE38K Federal, (American Eagle) .38 Special +P, 130 Grain FMJ 2,000 1,000 2 $0.00 $0.60 $402.51 $805.02
4 AE40R1 Federal, (American Eagle) .40 Caliper, 180 Grain FMJ 100,000 1,000 100 $0.00 $0.00 $327.62 $32,752.00
5 P40OHST1 Federal HST .40 Caliper, 180 Grain HST 60,000 1.000 80 $0.00 $0.00 $402.20 $24,132.00
6 AE45A Federal (American Eagle) .45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ 15,000 1,000 15 $0.00 $0.00 $359.34 $5,390.10
7 P4SHST1 Federal HST .45 ACP Caliper, 230 Grain, +PJHP 25,000 1,000 25 $0.00 $0.00 $473.15 $11.828.75
8 24446 Speer Gold DOT .223 Rem. 55 Grain GDSP 70,000 00 140 $0.00 $0.00 $283.71 $39.719.40
9 T223A Federal Tactical Tru .223 Rem., 55 Grain, Hi Shock SP 11.000 500 2 $0.00 $0.00 $292.10 $6.426.20
10 LE223T1 Federal Tactical Bonded .223 Rem. 55 grain, Bonded, SP 10.000 200 50 $0.00 $0.00 | | $241.87 $12.093.50
i1 AE223 Federal (American Eagle) .223 Rem. 55 Grain, FMJBT 13,000 500 26 $0.00 $0.00 $224.80 $5.844.80
12 XM193X Federal, 5.56mm x 46mm, 55 Grain, MCBT 120.000 500 300 $0.00 $o.00 $224.80 $67.440.00
13 LE132 00 Federal 12 Gauge Ammo, 2-3/4" 00 Buckshot 1.000 250 4 $0.00 $0.00 $170.54 $682.16
14 LE308T1 Federal .308 cal. Win. 165 grain Tactical Bonded 10,000 200 50 $0.00 $0.00 $334.97 $16,748.50
15 F130-00 Federal 12 Gauge Classic, 2-3/4", 00 Buckshot, 12 Pellet 4,000 250 16 $0.00 $0.00 $174.65 $2.794.40
18 TGL129 Federal Top Gun Target, 2-3/4", #9 1.000 250 4 $0.00 $0.00 $84.12 $336.48
17 POHST2 Federal 9MM, 147 Grain, Standard Velocity 85,000 1,000 85 $0.00 $0.00 $36219 $30,786.15
” . Federal SMM. 147 grain. FMJ 138,000 1,000 138 $0.00 $0.00 $229.15 $31,622.70
e Btote $0.00 $290,169.26
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 $290,169.26
Terms NO BID Net 45 Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 1 90-540 Days ARO




BID #22-680-057

AMMUNITION
Category 2: Winchester Ammunition ® Uoos_,mﬂm””h”ﬂnw@m_ ine. .Emm%_”..%:_.wﬂw Mmm_om
8an Diego, CA
Bid # Part # Description >=m_w“w_“am,mmuuo xo,m.mnmmvmq mwﬂ.,.qum”“_ #|| unitprice | Extension Unit Price | Extension

19 RA45T Winchester, Ranger .45 Cal. JHP 230 grain, T-Series . 500 10 $224.00 $2240.00 $0.00
20 AASC129 Winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8” oz. load, #9 shot 2,000 250 8 $98.50 $788.00 $0.00
21 AAM129 Winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8" oz. load, #9 shot 2,000 250 8 $38.50 $788.00 $0.00
22 XBP12 Winchester 12 Gauge Black Powder Blanks, Super-X 1,000 250 4 $273.50 $1.004.00 $0.00
23 X12RS15 Winchester 12 gauge, 1oz. Super-X Slug 8.000 . 32 $158.50 $5.072.00 $0.00
24 RA12RS15 Winchester 12 gauge Slug, toz. Low recoil 8,000 250 . $158.50 $5.072.00 $0.00
25 RA1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot. 9 Pellet. Low Recoil 10000 250 40 ¥149.00 $5.960.00 30
2 XB1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, 9 Pellet 100%0 250 40 it $5,960.00 $0.00
7 Removed o 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
28 USAIMM Winchester 9MM Lugar, 124 Grain, FMJ 40,000 . . $119.00 $9.520.00 $0.00
28 Q4172 Winchester 9MM Lugar, 115 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 311900 | $9.520.00 $0.00
. WM193420CS %MM:mm_sﬁwﬂ 5.56, 55 Grain, M193 Ball, 10-Round Stripper 150,360 840 179 $453.60 $81.194.40 $0.00

Subtotal $127.208.40 $0.00

Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 e $0.00

Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $127,208.40 $0.00

Terms Net 45 Days NO BID

Delivery ARO 90-380 Days ARC CATEGORY 2




BID #22-680-057

AMMUNITION
. (B) San Diego Police
Category 3: Hornady Ammunition {A) Dooley Enterprises, Inc. Equipment Co.
Anaheim, CA ;
San Diego, CA
Bid # Part # Description Estimated | Rounds per | Est. Annual#| | i price | Extension Unit Price | Extension
Annual Usage Case of Cases
31 83276 Hornady, .223 Rem. 55 grain TAP S9,000 s . SO0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
» 80965 Hornady, .308 Win. 168 grain TAP AMAX 5,000 200 2 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
%5 8270 Hornady, 50 BMG 750 grain AMAX 1,000 100 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
34 90215 Hotnady, Critical Duty SMM, Luger+P, 124 Grain, FlexLock|  ~""o0 500 o $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00
0, 0,
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
0,
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 G $0.00
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 $0.00
Terms NO BiD NO BID
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 3 CATEGORY 3




BID #22-680-057

AMMUNITION
. (B) San Diego Police
Category 4: CCl Ammunition (A} Dooley Enterprises, Inc. Equipment Co.
Anaheim, CA N
San Diego, CA
Bid # Part # Description Estimated Rounds per | Est. Annual # Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Annual Usage Case of Cases
CCl Velocitor .22 cal, Long Rifle 40 grain Copper Plated
- 0047 Hollow Point (CPHP) 5,000 5,000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $559.96 $559.96
- 925CC CCl Copper .22 cal, Lang Rifle 21 grain GHP 5,000 5,000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $847.82 $847.82
Subtotal $0.00 $1,407.78
0, L]
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
0,
Less Terms Discount e $0.00 ae $0.00
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 $1.407.78
Terms NO BID Net 45 Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 4 980.540 Days ARO
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