The County of El Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division
Phone (530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 23-288-048
Aggregate Base Materials — West Slope

The apparent low qualified bidder for the subject bid is Teichert Rock Products of Sacramento,
CA.

This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, 4/4/2023. Board of
Supervisors Policy C-17, Section 3.3.1 (F), contains the procedure for the protest process.
Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, a purchase contract will be issued for the
awarded period.

This notification is posted on the following websites:

https:pbsystem.planetbids.com/portal/48157/portal-home

https://www.edcgov.us/Government/Contracts/Pages/Bid-Results. aspx

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office and are available to review by
appointment between 8:00 a.m. — 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. — 4:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday.
For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer (530) 621-5873.

*‘Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.
WA]@%I\/

Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 95667


https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAA-XY_pzNr9-pnfr_OZirpMX1e8kFFkFr4

EVALUATION - BID #23-288-048
AGGREGATE BASE MATERIALS - WEST SLOPE

Grant Line Plant $15.00 / Ton

GrantLine Plant $38.00 / Ton

jRecycled Rock

HAULING EXPENSE CALCULATION y | Fst Annual Commodity ¥ of Trips /
Usage | Tons Rounded
Cost of Driver/Truck $50.00/hour 1 750 7" Aggregate Base (Type |l, Class B) 50
Average Speed 30 miles per hour 2 400 1-4 %" Drain Rock 27
RATE TO HAUL $50.00 / 30 mph = $1.67/mile 3 200 4" Drain Rock 13
Average Truck Capacity 15 tons 4 200 Backing/Ditch Rock #2 (6-12") 13
5 50 Backing/Ditch Rock #3 (4-10") 3
6 150 #1 Facing (8-14") 10
7 100 Light B 7
_nwa VENDOR Miles 1-Way x| 2 |x| Hawling Rate | = | Mileage Cost| X Total Trips + m..m_hmq___ﬂm“.u_ =| Total Hauling
1 Teichert Construction - Cool Plant 24.60 X 2 X $1.67 = $82.16 X 50 + % 42500 = $4,533.00
2 Teichert Construction - Cool Plant 24.60 X 2 X 3167 = $82.16 X 27 + 3 22950 = $2,447 82
3 Teichert Construction - Cool Flant 2460 X 2 X $1.67 = 382 16 X 13 + 3 11050 = $1,178 58
4 Teichert Construction - Cool Plant 24.80 X 2 X $1.67 = 38218 X 13 + 8 11050 = $1,178.58
& Teichert Construction - Cacl Plant 2460 X 2 X $1.67 = $82.16 X 3 + 3 2550 = $271.98
6 Teichert Construction - Cocl Flant 24.60 X 2 X $1.67 = $8216 X 10 + $ 8500 = $906.60
7  Teicher Canstruction - Cool Plant 24.60 X 2 X $1.67 = $82 16 X 7 + 8 5950 = 3634 62
_,wa VENDOR Miles 1-Way |[X| 2 |xX| Haufing Rate | = | Mileage cost | X Total Trips + m:m“MﬂﬂmnE =| Tota! Hauting
1 Granite Construction - Bradshaw Plant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = $106.88 X 50 + § 600.00 = $5,944.00
2 Granite Construction - Bradshaw Plant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = 310688 X 27 + § 32400 = $3,209.78
3 Granite Constructicn - Bradshaw Piant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = $106.88 X 13 + $ 15600 = $1,545 44
4 Granite Construction - Bradshaw Plant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = $106.88 X 13 + S 15600 = 31,545 44
5 Granite Construction - Bradshaw Flant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = $106.88 X 3 + % 3600 = $356 64
€ Granite Construction - Bradshaw Plant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = $106.88 X 10 + $ 12000 = $1,188.80
7  Granite Construction - Bradshaw Plant 32.00 X 2 X $1.67 = $106.88 X 7 + S 8400 = $832.16
T VENDOR Cost per Ton | x| Tons |=|  Bid Totat . om””””t = | Product Subtotal | + Hauling = mcw_hm.ﬂa
Teichert Construction - Cool Plant 1%/1G Days
1 |%" Agagregate Base (Type II, Class B) s 16.50 750 = $12,375.00 - $0.00 = $12,375.00 + $453300 =| $16,908.00
2 |1-1 %" Drain Rock S 28.00 400 = $11,600.00 - $0.00 = $11,600.00 + $4.533 00 = $16,133.00
3 |4" Drain Rock $ 24.00 200 = $4,800.00 - $0.00 = $4,800.00 + $2,44782 = $7,247.82
4 |Backing/Ditch Rock #2 (6-12") $ 34 00 200 = $6,800.00 - $0.00 = $6,800.00 + $2,447 82 = $9,247 .82
5 |Backing/Ditch Rock #3 (4-10") 3 3400 50 = $1,700.00 - $0.00 = $1,700.00 + $27198 = $1,971.98
6 |#1 Facing (8-14") $ 38.00 150 = $5,700.00 - $0.00 = $5,700.00 + $906 60 = $6,606 60
7 |Light8 3 38.00 100 = $3,800.00 - 3000 = $3,800.00 + S63462 =| $4,43462
_»MB VENDOR Cost per Ton | X| Tons |= Bid Total - E.MMM”_.M» . | = | Product Subtotal |+ Hauing - mq“_o_.n””mn
Granite Contruction - Bradshaw Plant Net 45 Days
1_[% Aggregale Base (Type II, Class B) ] 17.50 750 =  $13,125.00 - $0.00 . $13,125.00 + $594400 =| $18,069.00
2 |1-1 %" Drain Rock NO BID 400 = H#VALUEI - 50.00 = #VALUE! + $594400 = #VALUE!
3 [4" Drain Rock NO BID 200 = #VALUEI - 30.00 = HVALUE! + $320876 = #YALUE!
4 |Backing/Ditch Rock #2 {6-12") NO BID 200 = #VALUEI - $0.00 = HVALUE! + $320876 = #VALUE!
5 {Backing/Ditch Rock #3 {4-1G") NO BID 50 = HVALUE! = $0.00 = H#VALUE! + $356.64 = #VALUE]
6 #1 Facing (8-14") NO BID 150 = #VALUE] - $0.00 = #VALUE! + $1,i8880 = #YALUE!
7 |LightB NO BID 00 = #VALUE! - §0.00 = #VALUE] + $83216 = HVALUE!
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