The County of El Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division
Phone {530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 24-680-016
Ammunition.

The apparent low qualified bidders for the subject bid are:

Category 1: San Diego Police Equipment Company, Inc. of San Diego, CA.
Category 2: Dooley Enterprises, Inc. of Anaheim, CA.

Category 3: Miwall Corporation of Grass Valley, CA.

Category 4: San Diego Police Equipment Company, Inc. of San Diego, CA.

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.
This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, November 5, 2023.

Board of Supervisors Policy C-17, section 5.6.5, contains the procedure for the protest process.
Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, a purchase order / purchase contract will be
issued for the awarded period.

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office and are available to review by

appointment between 8:00 a.m. — 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. — 4:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer (530) 621-5873.

. Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

DIl errme

Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 95667



https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAApQDkvtmf3GQxxZKZouuhuvHILFhIreZF
https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAApQDkvtmf3GQxxZKZouuhuvHILFhIreZF

BID #24-680-016

AMMUNITION
Category 1: Federal/Speer Ammunition D°°Iexn§';::i:ri2;5’ nc. Sg:‘D[ego P::esinug;g?t M(;v::slgc\;?g?g;n Protectic:_n;:ll:;'rg:tics e
Bid # Part # Description Af:::{‘ﬁ’::ge Ro "c":;“r Es;‘:‘:';';‘;' #1| unitprice | Extension UnitPrice | Extension UnitPrice | Extenslon UnitPrice | Extension
1 53021 Speer Gold DGT 38 Special +P, 135 Grain GDHP-5B 1,000 1.000 1 000 3000 $509 40 $509 40 3000 $0.00 $33264 $33264
2 53833 Speer, Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain TMJFN 1,000 1.000 1 3000 50.00 $38592 $385 92 000 $0.00 563500 $635 00
3 24448 Speer Gold DOT 223 Rem 55 Grain GDSP 70.000 500 140 000 50.00 $320 20 346,086 00 3000 $0.00 3267 12 $37.396 80
4 AE38K Federal, {Amencan Eagle) 38 Special +P, 130 Grain FMJ 2,000 1.000 2 $000 so000 $429 15 $858 3¢ 5000 $0.00 $635 00 $1,27000
5 AE40R1 Federal, {American Eagle) 40 Calipsr, 180 Gram FMJ 100,000 1.000 100 $0 00 3000 $355 80 $35590 00 S000 $0.00 $278 48 $27.846 00
6 PAOHET Federal HST 40 Caliper, 180 Gram HST 60,00C 1,000 80 $000 50 00 $47919 $28751 40 $000 $0.00 $388 00 $23,28000
7 AE4SA Federal (American Eagle) 45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ 15,000 1.006 15 $0 00 50 00 $394 45 35816 75 3000 $0.00 $3090 96 §4.649 40
8 P4SHST1 Federal HST 45 ACP Caliper, 230 Grain, +PJHP 25,000 1,000 25 $G00 S0 00 $628 16 $13.226 00 5000 $0.00 5414 54 $10,363 50
o T223A Federal Tactcal Tru 223 Rem , 55 Grain, Ht Shock SP 11,000 500 2 $000 3000 $334 22 $7.362 84 3000 $0.00 $211 68 54,656 95
10 LE223T1 Federal Tactical Bonded 223 Rem 55 grain, Bonded, SP 10,000 200 50 $G 00 $0 00 $25270 $12,63500 $G 00 $0.00 $31500 $15,750 00
1 AE2Z3 Federal {Amencan Eagle) 223 Rem 55 Grain FMJET 13,000 500 26 $0C0 5000 $25194 $6,550 44 $0.00 $0.00 $383 00 $9,958 00
12 XhA1e3x Discontinued 0 500 0 $000 $0.00 $0 00 $000 000 $0.00 $0 00 $0.00
132 LE132 00 Federal 12 Gauge Ammo, 2-3/4" 00 Buekshot 1.000 250 4 $000 3000 $208 40 5833 60 $600 $0.00 $283 50 51,134 00
4 LE308T2 Federal 308 cal Win 168 grain Tactical Bonded Tip 10,000 200 50 $0.00 3G C0 $392.60 $18,630 00 $0 00 $0.00 5466 20 $23,31000
15 F-130-00 Federal 12 Gauge Classic. 2-3/4", 00 Buckshot, 12 Pellet 4,000 250 18 $0.00 3000 $21224 $3,3595 384 $000 $0 00 $535 50 58568 00
16 TGL12 Federal Top Gun Target, 2-3/4", #9 1.000 250 4 $0.00 8000 $87 40 $348 60 $000 $0 00 $99 64 $398 16
17 PEHET2 Federal 9MM . 147 Grain, Standard Velocity 25,000 1,000 85 $0.00 $G00 $423 35 $35984 75 $000 | $000 $690 48 $58,680 80
18 AESFP Federal 9MM 147 gram, FMJ 138,000 1,000 138 $0.00 $000 $257 10 $3547930 $000 : $0 00 $409 50 336,511 00
Subtotal 000 $253,540 64 | $0 00 5284750 26
Less §% LVP 2% $000 0% S0 00 0% [ $C Q0 0% $0 00
Less Terms Discount 0% $000 0% $000 0% $C0 00 5% 51)
Evaluation (Daes not include Sales Tax) $000 $253,540.64 $0 00 3270512 75
Terms NO BID Net 45 Days NO BID 5% 21 Days Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 1 30-450 Days ARO CATEGORY 1 S0 Days ARQ




BID #24-680-016
AMMUNITION

Dooley Enterprises, Inc.

San Diego Police Equipment

Miwall Corporation

Protection Plus Tactics LLC

Category 2: Winchester Ammunition Anaheim, GA Co. s $an Diego, Grass Valley, CA Loomis, GA
Bid # Part # Description AE::LTS?adge Rotgnadsseper Es:‘f‘:‘;:;izl e Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
19 RA45T Winchester, Ranger 45 Cal JHP 230 gramn, ¥-Series 5000 500 10 $233 50 $2.33500 3000 3000 s000 $0.00 $504 00 $5,040 00
20 AASC128 IWir*tc:hestﬁ-r 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8" oz load, #8 shot 2,000 250 8 $107 00 $886 00 $0.00 $000 $000 30.00 $126 00 $1.008 00
21 AAM129 IWinl:;hester 12 gauge AATrap 1 1/8" oz toad. #9 shot 2000 250 8 $107.00 $836 00 $000 $000 5000 $000 $264 80 $2,116 B0
22 XBP12 Winchester 12 Gauge Black Powder Blanks, Super-X 1.600 250 4 $2098 25 $1193 00 $0.00 $0 00 %000 $000 $630 00 $2,520 00
23 X12R815 Winchestar 12 gauge, 10z Super-X Slug 8,000 250 32 $173.75 $5,560 00 5000 $0Co $000 $0.00 $403.20 $12,802.40
24 RAI2RS15 Winchester 12 gauge Slug, 1oz, Low recml 8,000 250 32 317375 $5,560 0O $0 00 $0 00 S0 00 $0.00 $315.00 $1i0,080 00
25 RA1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, 8 Pellet, Low Recoil 10,000 250 40 $164 00 $6.560 00 $0 00 $C 00 $000 $0.00 $31500 $12.80000
26 XB1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, § Pellat 10,000 250 a0 $164 Q0 £6.560 00 $0.00 3000 $000 $0.00 $226 80 $8.072 00
27 USABMM Winchester SMM Lugar, 124 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 $124 50 $9,96000 $000 3000 $000 §0.C0| $144 90 $11,592 00
28 Q72 Wmnchester S9MM Lugar, 115 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 $124 50 $9,960 00 $000 $000 $000 $000 $158 76 $12,700.80
2 | wmigsazocs g:;:“;:j’ 556,55 Gram. M193 Ball 10-Round Stripper | 15 40 840 179 $525 00 $93,975 00 s000 $000 $000 soco| | ssteo0 | s446.60100
Subtotal $143.375 00 3000 $0.00 $226,233.00
Less 5% LVP Q% 000 0% 3000 ;% $0.00 0% $0.00
Less Terms Discount 0% £000 0% 000 0% $0.00 5%
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $143,375.00 300G $0.00 £214,921.35
Terms Net 45 Days NO BID NO BID 5% 21 Days Days
5-180 Days ARO CATEGORY 2 CATEGORY 2 90 Days ARO

Delivery ARC




BID #24-680-016
AMMUNITION

San Diego Police Equipment

. . Dooley Enterprises, Inc. " Miwall Corparation Protection Plus Tactics LLC

Category 3: Hornady Ammunition Anaheim, GA Co. -, San Diego, Grass Valley, CA Loomis, CA

|
i | . Estimated Rounds per | Est. Annual # e . - e .

Bid # Part # Description Annual Usage Case of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
30 83276 Hernady 223 Rem 55 grair TAP 80000 200 450 $000 S0 00 S000 $000 168 43 $75,793 50 $252 00 $113.400 00
31 80985 Hornady 308 Win 168 grain TAP AMAX 5,000 200 25 $0 00 s00c 5000 $000 526561 $6.840 25 $31500 $7.87500
az 8270 Hornady, 50 BMG 750 grain AMAX 1.00G 400 10 3000 $000 $000 3000 $677 14 S8 771,40 $945 00 $9 45000

I
33 80215 |Hornady, Criteal Duty SMM, Luger+P, 124 Grain, FlexLock 5,000 500 10 300G $0 00 8000 S000 $279 44 $2.794 40 $579 680 $5,796 00
Subtotal 5000 $000 $91.998 55 5136,521 00
Less 5% LVP 0% 3000 0% 5000 0% $0.00 0% $000
Less Terms Discount 0% S000 0% 3000 0% 3000 5%
Evaluation (Doss not include Sales Tax) $000 $090 $91,999.55 $120.604 05
Terms NG BID NO BID Net 45 Days 3% 21 Days Days
Delivery AROQ CATEGORY 3 CATEGORY 3 30-450 Days ARC 80 Days ARQ
Category 4: GGl Ammunition Docley Enterprises, Inc. Sg: Diego Po"“;:”g;;“ int Miwall Corporation Protection Plus Tacfics LLC
egory 4 Anaheim, CA ) CA 80, Grass Valley, CA Loomis, CA
Estimated Rounds per | Est. Annual # ]
Bid # Part # Description e P P Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension
Annual Usage Case of Cases |
en 2047 CCI Vekwitor 22 cal. Lang Rifle 40 gram Copper Plated 5,000 5,000 1 5000 soon || seepap $662.40 5000 sooo || s138800 $1.386 00
Holkwy Ponst (CPHP)
35 825CC CClCopper 22 cal, Long Rifle 21 grain CHP 5000 5,000 1 $0C0 $000 $824 22 $824 22 S0 00 $0.00 $1,145634 $1.145 34
Subtotal 3000 51616862 $0.00 52531 34
Less 5% LVP 0% 3000 0% 300G 0% 30.00 0% S000
Less Terms Discount 0% 30 00 0% $000 0% $0 00 5%
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) 000 $1,616.62 3000 ] 52404 77
Terms NO BID Net 45 Days NOBID 5% 21 Days Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 4 30-450 Days ARO CATEGORY 4 90 Days ARQ
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