The County of EIl Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Conftracts Division
Phone (530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS
RE: BID # 24-0059
Emulsion: $8-1H and PMCRS-2H

The apparent low qualified bidder for the subject bid is VSS Emultech of West Sacramento, CA
for both Category “1” and Category “2".

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.

Board of Supervisors Policy C-17, Section 3.3.1, Subsection F, contains the procedure for the
protest process. Copies are available upon request.

A purchase order will be issued ten (10) business days following the date this notification is
posted on the following websites:

https:pbsystem.planetbids.com/portal/48157 {portal-home

https.//www.eldoradocounty.ca.gov/County-Government/Procurement-and-Contracts/Bid-Results

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office and are available to review by
appointment between 8:00 a.m. — 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. - 4:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer (530) 621-5873.

" Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

DAl St

Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 95667


https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAAojZYtFACIim4Gdcm7wBFi_EjRv8F1zZ5
https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAAojZYtFACIim4Gdcm7wBFi_EjRv8F1zZ5

Bid 24-0059
Emulsion:
$8-1H, PMCRS-2H
West Slope

HAULING CALCULATION - CATEGORY 1"

Commodity # of Trips
Cost of Driver/Truck $58.50/hour S$S-1H Emulsion - West Slope 24
Average Speed 30 miles per hour
RATE TO HAUL $58.50 / 30 mph = $1.95/mile
Average Truck Capacity 1 ton
Estimated Usage 24 tons
VENDCR Miles 1-Way X 2 X Hauling Rate = Mileage Cost X Total Trips = Total Hauling ARQ
VS8S Emultech 46.0 X 2 X $1.95 = $179.40 X 24 = $4,305.80 5 Days
Vulcan materials Company 36.1 X 2 X $1.95 = $140.79 X 24 = $3,378.96
Raynguard Protective Materials 36.2 X 2 X $1.95 = $141.18 X 24 = $3,388.32 i Day
|CATEGORY "1": SS-1H EMULSION
Terms
PRODUCT / SCHEDULE CostperTon X Tons = Bid Total - Discount* = ProductSubtotal + Hauling = Evaluated Total
Net 45 Days
V5SS Emultech $800.00 X 24 = $1920000 - $0.00 = $19,200.00 $4,305.60 $23,505.60
Net 45 Days
Vulcan materials Company $2,300.00 X 24 = §$5520000 - $0.00 = $5520000 $3,378.96 $58,578.96
Net 45 Days
Raynguard Protective Materials $1,015.24 X 24 = $2436576 - $0.00 = $24,365.76 $3,388.32 $27.754.08




Bid 24-0059

Emulsion:
$5-1H, PMCRS-2H
West Sliope
HAULING CALCULATION - CATEGORY "2"
Commodity #of Trips
Cost of Driver/Truck $ 5850 PMCRS-2H Emulstion 10
Average Speed 30 miles per hour
RATE TO HAUL $58.50 f 30 mph = $1.95/mile
Average Truck Capacity 1ton
Estimated Usage 10ton
VENDOR Miles 1-Way X 2 X Hauling Rate = Mileage Cost X Total Trips = Total Hauling ARO
VSS Emultech 46.0 X 2 X $1.95 = $179.40 X 10 = $1,794.00 5 Days
|Vulcan materials Company 0.0 X 2 X $1.95 = $0.00 X 10 = $0.00 No Bid
Raynguard Protective Materials 0.0 X 2 X $1.95 e $0.00 X 10 = $0.00 No Bid
CATEGORY "2": CRS$-2H EMULSION
Terms
PRODUCT f SCHEDULE CostperTon X Tons = Bid Total - Disgount* = Product Subtotal + Hauling = Evaluated Total

Net 45 Days
VS8 Emultech $200.00 X 10 = $8,000.00 - $0.00 = $9,000.00 $1,794.00 $10,794.00

Net 45 Days
Vulecan materials Company $0.00 X 10 = $0.00 - $0.00 = $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Net 45 Days
Raynguard Protective Materials $0.00 X 10 = 000 - $0.00 = $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
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